
Care of the dying person

Care of the dying person tools and resources for use in clinical
practice, education and training 

Read this guide
Managing palliative care symptoms:
A guide for health professionals
from caring@home (3.7MB pdf)
Support patients and their families to
manage palliative care symptoms

Access this tool
Imminent death: How to respond
(456kb pdf)
Use this checklist by End-of-Life
Essentials when assessing the
possibility of imminent death 

Download this app
CareSearchgp app
A digital tool for GPs that provides
easy access to guidance on palliative
care for patients living at home or in
residential facilities 

Complete this form
Supportive and Palliative Care
Indicators Tool (SPICT) (315kb pdf)
A tool for easily identifying
deteriorating health and assessing for
unmet palliative care needs

Implement this tool
PREPARED model for clinicians
(180kb pdf)
Learn how to conduct
conversations about dying with
example phrases and questions

Optimise your learning
Recognising the end of life
Recognise the clinical signs that a
person is approaching death using
this checklist from the End-of-Life
Essentials toolkit
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https://www.caresearch.com.au/Health-Professionals/General-Practitioner/CareSearchgp-App
https://www.endoflifeessentials.com.au/Portals/14/document/MyToolkitChecklists/Recognising-the-End-of-Life_MyToolkit.pdf
https://www.caresearch.com.au
https://www.caringathomeproject.com.au/Portals/13/Documents/Handbook-Clinicians-WEB.pdf
https://www.endoflifeessentials.com.au/Portals/14/document/MyToolkitChecklists/Imminent-Death_How-to-Respond_MyToolkit.pdf
https://www.caresearch.com.au/Portals/20/Documents/Forms/SPICT_Fillable-Form_CS.pdf
https://www.wnswphn.org.au/uploads/documents/ePAF/9%20-%20LDOL-Toolkit-PREPARED-Model-for-clinicians-Final-April-2016.PDF

